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Bid Tabulation: Kunkel Engineering Group
Mill Street - Sidewalk Beaver Dam, Wisconsin
City of Green Lake, Wisconsin Bid Date: 2/26/2010 1:00 p.m. Ph:  920-356-9447   Fax:  920-356-9454

Egbert Excavating, Inc. Kopplin & Kinas Co. Inc. Rennhack Construction Ptaschinski Construction Sommers Construction Co, Inc.
Green Lake, WI Green Lake, WI Reeseville, WI Beaver Dam, WI Shiocton, WI

No. Bid Items Unit Unit Price Bid Unit Price Bid Unit Price Bid Unit Price Bid Unit Price Bid
A) Unclassified Excavation 1 LS $18,590.00 $18,590.00 $13,222.00 $13,222.00 $10,675.00 $10,675.00 $38,120.00 $38,120.00 $27,000.00 $27,000.00
B) 12" Storm Sewer 200 LF $19.00 $3,800.00 $24.17 $4,834.00 $24.35 $4,870.00 $50.00 $10,000.00 $75.00 $15,000.00
C) Storm Curb Inlet 1 EA $1,250.00 $1,250.00 $1,296.00 $1,296.00 $1,306.35 $1,306.35 $1,300.00 $1,300.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00
D) 6" Storm Sewer Drains 80 LF $22.50 $1,800.00 $39.75 $3,180.00 $40.05 $3,204.00 $40.00 $3,200.00 $30.00 $2,400.00
E) Granular Backfill (Storm Sewer) 200 LF $4.00 $800.00 $1.00 $200.00 $1.00 $200.00 $1.00 $200.00 $15.00 $3,000.00
F) 30" Concrete Curb & Gutter 280 LF $26.50 $7,420.00 $12.98 $3,634.40 $12.98 $3,634.40 $15.00 $4,200.00 $50.00 $14,000.00
G) 3.5" Asphalt Patch 160 SY $43.50 $6,960.00 $40.00 $6,400.00 $40.00 $6,400.00 $39.70 $6,352.00 $45.00 $7,200.00
H) Concrete Sidewalk 2,800 SF $4.40 $12,320.00 $3.85 $10,780.00 $3.85 $10,780.00 $4.85 $13,580.00 $6.00 $16,800.00
I) Concrete Foundation & Footing 80 CY $193.60 $15,488.00 $204.00 $16,320.00 $203.80 $16,304.00 $100.00 $8,000.00 $450.00 $36,000.00
J) Concrete Stairs 99 SF/TR $62.73 $6,210.27 $44.00 $4,356.00 $44.00 $4,356.00 $80.00 $7,920.00 $135.00 $13,365.00
K) Painted Handrail 250 LF $110.00 $27,500.00 $155.00 $38,750.00 $242.00 $60,500.00 $179.00 $44,750.00 $125.00 $31,250.00
L) Sawcut Pavement & Sidewalk 400 LF $2.15 $860.00 $1.75 $700.00 $2.50 $1,000.00 $2.00 $800.00 $4.00 $1,600.00
M) Traffic Control & Access 1 LS $500.00 $500.00 $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $850.00 $850.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $5,400.00 $5,400.00
N) Erosion Control 1 LS $50.00 $50.00 $100.00 $100.00 $200.00 $200.00 $300.00 $300.00 $500.00 $500.00
O) Materials & Compaction Testing Allowan 1 LS $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00

TOTAL BASE BID $106,048.27 $107,872.40 $126,779.75 $142,222.00 $180,015.00

Alt #1 

Cultured Stone Veneer - Allowance No Bid $10,200.00 $10,200.00 $10,200.00 $10,200.00
Installation 680 SF $18.50 $12,580.00 $18.12 $12,321.60 $15.33 $10,424.40 $12.00 $8,160.00 $0.00
TOTAL: $12,580.00 $22,521.60 $20,624.40 $18,360.00 No Bid

Alt #2

Ornamental Railing - Allowance No Bid $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00
Installation 250 LF $240.00 $60,000.00 $19.30 $4,632.00 $40.30 $10,075.00 $40.00 $1,612.00 $0.00
TOTAL: $60,000.00 $64,632.00 $70,075.00 $61,612.00 No Bid

Alt #3

Mill & Replace 3.5" Asphalt Pavement 1,140 SY $19.50 $22,230.00 $18.25 $20,805.00 $17.95 $20,463.00 $20.00 $22,800.00 $25.00 $28,500.00
TOTAL: $22,230.00 $20,805.00 $20,463.00 $22,800.00 $28,500.00

ALTERNATES:
Provide & install cultured stone veneer at exposed 
foundation wall.

Provide & install ornamental wrought iron railing and 
support posts in lieu of painted metal.

Remove & replace the remaining asphalt pavement at 
Mill Street from concrete pavement at South Street to 
saw cut line at Hill Street.
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