Bid Tabulation:
2010 Road Improvement Project

Kunkel Engineering Group
Beaver Dam, Wisconsin

Town of Ixonia, Wisconsin Bid Date: 5/28/10 10:00 a.m. Ph: 920-356-9447 Fax: 920-356-9454
Payne & Dolan Inc. Wolf Paving| Fahrner Asphalt Sealers, LLC Scott Construction, Inc.
Fitchburg, WI Oconomowoc, WI Waunakee, WI Lake Delton, WI
No. Bid Items Unit Unit Price Bid|  Unit Price Bid Unit Price Bid| Unit Price Bid
CONTRACT #1 - SECTION A
1) Pulverize Existing Asphalt Pavement 6,400 SY $3.05 $19,520.00 $1.22 $7,808.00 $0.00 $0.00
2) Sawcut Existing Pavement 200 LF $2.50 $500.00 $2.00 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00
3) EBS & Sub-Base Course 1,000 CY $13.65 $13,650.00 $35.00 $35,000.00 $0.00 $0.00
4) Asphalt Lower Layer, E-3 19mm 2 1/4" 900 TN $49.75 $44,775.00 $47.00 $42,300.00 $0.00 $0.00
5) Asphlat Upper Layer, E-3 12.5mm, 13/£ 700 TN $53.00 $37,100.00 $57.00 $39,900.00 $0.00 $0.00
6) Aggregate Shoulder, 6" 1,600 TN $12.60 $20,160.00 $16.80 $26,880.00 $0.00 $0.00
7) Silt Fence 400 LF $1.15 $460.00 $1.80 $720.00 $0.00 $0.00
8) Topsoil & Seeding 1,200 SY $3.75 $4,500.00 $6.35 $7,620.00 $0.00 $0.00
9) Traffic Control & Access 1LS $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $600.00 $600.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total Base Bid - Section A $141,865.00 $161,228.00
CONTRACT #1 - SECTION B
1) Sawcut Existing Pavement 200 LF $2.50 $500.00 $2.00 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00
2) Asphalt Lower Layer, E-3 19mm 2-1/4" 200 TN $52.40 $10,480.00 $63.38 $12,676.00 $0.00 $0.00
3) Asphalt Upper Layer, E-3 12.5mm, 1-3/¢ 160 TN $65.90 $10,544.00 $56.56 $9,049.60 $0.00 $0.00
4) Traffic Control & Access 1LS $3,656.00 $3,656.00 $800.00 $800.00 $0.00 $0.00
4) Alternate: Pulverize Existing Asphalt Pe 1,350 SY $0.75 $1,012.50 $2.00 $2,700.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total Base Bid - Section B $25,180.00 $22,925.60
CONTRACT #1 - SECTION C
1) Pulverize Existing Asphalt Pavement 3,500 SY $1.00 $3,500.00 $1.99 $6,965.00 $0.00 $0.00
2) Sawcut Existing Pavement 200 LF $2.50 $500.00 $2.00 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00
3) EBS & Sub-Base Course 550 CY $27.45 $14,274.00 $35.00 $19,250.00 $0.00 $0.00
4) Asphlat Lower Layer, E-3, 19mm, 2-1/4' 520 TN $49.75 $19,900.00 $48.00 $24,960.00 $0.00 $0.00
5) Asphalt Lower Layer, E-3, 12.5mm, 1-3/ 400 TN $54.35 $48,915.00 $51.00 $20,400.00 $0.00 $0.00
6) Aggregate Shoulder, 6" 900 TN $12.80 $10,240.00 $16.80 $15,120.00 $0.00 $0.00
7) Silt Fence 800 LF $1.15 $920.00 $1.80 $1,440.00 $0.00 $0.00
8) Topsoil & Seeding 700 SY $3.75 $2,625.00 $6.35 $4,445.00 $0.00 $0.00
9) Traffic Control & Access 1LS $805.00 $805.00 $600.00 $600.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total Base Bid - Section C $101,679.00 $93,580.00
Total Base Bid (A+B+C) $268,724.00 $277,733.60 No Bid No Bid
CONTRACT #2
1) Roadway Seal Coat 36,000 SY $0.00 $0.00 $1.18 $42,480.00 $1.19 $42,768.00
2) Traffic Control & Access 1LS $0.00 $0.00 $180.00 $180.00 $100.00 $100.00
Total Base Bid (Contract #2) No Bid No Bid $42,660.00 $42,868.00
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